HIGH COURT OF MADHYA PRADESH : JABALPUR

ALy 9~
Endt. Nov//'fd'/ Jabalpur, dt./&2../01/2018
. 5.7 1j30] [PE)

i

The copy of the Gazette Notification published in M.P.
Rajpatra dated 26 April, 2016 and 15 December 2017 in
respect of "“Gender Sensitisation and Sexual Harrasment of
Women at the High Court of Madhya Pradesh and Subordinate
Courts (Prevention, Prohibition and Redressal) Regulations,
2015" is forwarded to :-

(i)The District & Sessions Judge .......ccccccovevenn.... , with a
request to bring the same into the knowledge of all the
Judicial Officers under their kind control, for information
and necessary action.

(i) The District & Sessions Judge (Inspection &
Vigilance), Jabalpur / Indore / Gwalior;

(ifi) The Director MPSJA for doing the needful .

(iv) The Principal Registrar, Bench at Indore/Gwalior
High Court of M.P., Jabalpur.

(v) P.S. to Hon'ble the Chief Justice ,High Court of
Madhya Pradesh  Jabalpur for placing the matter
before His Lordships

(vi) P.S. to Registrar General/ Principal Registrar(Judl)/
Principal Registrar (Inspection & Vigilance),/

Principal Registrar (Examination) / Principal
Registrar (ILR) High court of Madhya Pradesh
Jabalpur,

(vii) P.A. to Director/Additional Director/JOTRI, High
Court of Madhya Pradesh Jabalpur,

(viii) Registrar Admn/ (3.)/(D.E.)/(A)/ (Vig.)/ (VI.)/
(A.W.), High Court of Madhya Pradesh, Jabalpur.

(ix) The Registrar(IT) for uploading the same in NIC.

for information & appropriate action.

>\ -
SN ——

_/; lo M. s
(SANAT KUMAR KASHYAP)
REGISTRAR(DE)




T JGHIES www.govtpressmp.nic. in
B Wt grad el o a weha .

wA% 18] ‘ W ThaR, feie 29 ol 2016—dwTa 9, W% 1938
| fawa-get
(®) (1) meEwRy fadas, (2) war gfafa & wfgaed, (3) dug ¥ Q@ o,
(@ (1) FARY, (2) meayey rfufrm, (3) wug % Afyfqam.
(1) wEy faam, (2) 3f=m fram.

—— )_? :{ﬁ

YNl ¥ (@ )—FS &l

~ T ¥ (7)) ~
ey aw
fafur aiit faeamdt = fawm
. 1129-21-9-(T&)-2016 - ' o, fedie 26 e 2016

Approved Draft

THE GENDER SENSITISATION AND SEXUAL HARASSMENT OF WOMEN AT THE HIGH COURT OF
MADHYA PRADESH AND SUBORDINATES COURTS
(PREVENTION, PROHIBITION AND REDRESSAL)
REGULATIONS, 2015

361



[ w4 (m

yegyey qares, feqis 29 dd 2016

362

poynel usaq SeY UOIYym ‘USWON IsureSe UONBUTWLIOSIJ JO STWLIO [[€ JO UOQBUIWIH 33} U0
UOTIUSAUO)) SB YONS SPUSWINIISUL pUe SUCHUIAUOD [eUonRUISIUL £q SIUYSLI rewrny sazTu30031
bﬁmmhuﬂﬂﬂ ore AP YIIM 3jIom 0} JY3ILI 9l PUEB lUuswsserey enxss jsurede uonoojoid

sy pue opusS Jo SISEq oY) UO UONPUMMILIOSID jSureSe UONESHISUSS SVANAHM ANV

MEUQH jo ﬂoﬂaﬂwgoo ou1 jo (3) (1) 61 9onIVY Ispun Euawwmbw.ﬂ [eNX9s WO 991J JUSUIUOIIAUS
ores ® 0] 1USLI B SOpPN[OUl YOIYM Ssoursnq I0o sperl ‘uonednodo Aue uo Alred o1 IO uorssajoxd
Aue soroerd 01 1YSLI PUB BIPUJ JO UOTINIHSUOD 33 JO 1T wﬂo/ﬁg Iopun AJTU3Ip Uim SAI] 0} pue 91 0}
1US1I 1oy PUR BIPUJ JO UOTINIIISUOD 9U} JO GT PUB {1 SI[ONIY Iopun Amenbs o} uewom e Jo Repsine
TelusWepuUny 9yl Jo uone[ola ur _wﬁﬁmwh juswsserey ﬁ.mﬂxww PUB UOTJBUTWILIOSIP ISPUL3 m<m&mm M

S102Z ‘SNOILVINDTA
(TVSSAIaHTN ANV NOLLIGIHONd ‘NOLLNIATAJ)
SLINOD ALVYNITIOLNS S.LI ANV HSHAVId VAHAVIA 40O .LIN0D HOIH
FHIL LV NEINOM J0 INAWSSVAVH TVAXIS ANV NOILVSLLISNIS JHANID HHIL

ST0C'C0'91
LAVIA A




qr 4 (M) ]

HeayRy TwH, foia 29, e 2016

ur 30adsaisTp pue Aruspur ‘Aousdapul JO ULIO} Aue woxy uswom Furoa1oid Jjo A31Ss309U UL “L6T
530S 1 (£107) Ul pawodar Z10g 19qo100 61 U0 HNOH owardng 9y} Aq PsIopual ‘SIS0 PUE
BTPU] JO UOTU[) "A [T [eM}03] BYPSN Ul HNOD duraidng a1 Jo yuowSpn( oy Ut SVAYIHM ANV

‘uswiom Jo uonoaloid ayy I07 opraoid 01 Aressooau ST I(TTIOE OS L66T AV Ul parrodai)

26/04-999 ‘ON (‘1I0) uonmed LM UL ‘2661 ISNSNY €1 patep juewdpn( s1 ur 1Mo) swsIdng

ot} Aq perepusl UeUIseley JO 911G ‘A BNBUSIA UL UOISIOIP 9t 01 Surpiododoe QYVHNAHM ANV

¢019I91[] TEIUSPIOUL IO FIMIIS] PS}O2UU0D SI9}3e I0] pUE juswIsseIry [BNX3S JO syuredwoo

JO TessoIpal pue uonuoasxd 9y3 JIOf PUE sjouroaid s1Ino) djeurploqng s}t pue 1moH U3ty
’ \
ysope.ld BAUPBIN 911 1B USWOM JO JUSWSSEIBY [BNIXOS isurede uonoajold pue 1UQWIUOIIAUD

gunfIom Ul uonesnisueg Iopuosd I0j opraoxd 0} Aressadou ST U SVHNAHM ANV

‘s1ouroaid S1IMOYD d9yeurpioqns s}t pue Hno) YIIH ysspeid

eAUpBN 1 JUSWISSEIRY [BNXas jsurede UaWOM JO uorjosjord IO UOUSAUOD pres Sy} pPUe

BIPUJ JO UOMNINSUOD 3U3 03 109f° SulALd 10] suotstaotd axewr 0} 1USIPadxa ST 1 SYHNEHM ANV

‘erpuj JO JUWUIACD 9] Agq €661 ‘oun yicgy 2yl Uo




364

gy TS9d, feiw 29 tdet 2016

\ ‘. ‘pre8aI yey3 Ul polj 2q Aew jeU}
jurerdwoo Aue o [8ssaIpal 9yl JI0] SHNOD 2iBUIPIOgNS puUe YsIpeld eAype Jo 11no) YSIH 9l
J0 sjouroaxd oYUl UM JUSWISSBIBY [EBNX3S JO ﬁoﬁo.a 513 JBQUIOD 03 SUOREMS3al pourels 3uraey
5911TWIWOO Pres oY} PUE S1IN0S 91eurpioqns pue ‘1mo) Y3TH 3yl Jo sjouroaid oy} Ul USWIOM
I0] TUSWIUOIAUS SUD{IOM 9fES JINSUD 0 suone[ndal SuTurel I0f 99330 © parutodde ysepeid
eAupeq Jo 1INoD ySiyg oyl ‘Iyed jo 1noD USIH A 'SIO pue Blwe] nulg SN ‘€T10C JO 91
‘oN ([TATD) TWORHad LM Ul ‘9A0QE U3 Y AJTIOFuod ul pue uodn Jummoloy SYAYHHM ANV

‘pIedai siyl
UT PIsTeI S90UBAILLS 91} I9PISUOD A[SAT}OS[S 0] S}NOD 91} 0] SUOTIORIP 9} PUE SHITNO0D 2AT}09dsaI
o yoeoxdde o3 juswdpn( pres oy} wl pajueid A3Iaqr S PUE mm_.qoﬁmﬂoowmd« Teg pue S[OUNOD
Teq 93elS ‘eIpul JO [OUNOD Ted 9Y) SB UONS wm%_oﬁ \Qoﬁ/sﬁm e AQ SIEBNOIO /SUONIONLISUL SAI3
0} pa2u 21} 01 pIedol YIm SUOROSIp 93 SUIPNoul juswsdpnl pres oy} Ul USALS SUCTIOIIP TN
31} pue off Jo s9Isyds [[e url S[IS pUE USWOM JO JUSTWISOUBAPE PUE UOHEINPS JO ww>ﬂmﬂwﬂ_ﬁmg

op1aoid 0] PIIOSIIp U8aq SBY 1T Pue paziseydurs ST (SPISINO SE [[am SB SoWoY I3 ur) saoe[d [re




365

ey s, fEs 29 3 2016

4 (m ]

-:sa1nbal oSMMIS30 1x2]1U02 91} S$SUn ‘guonyeNSay 983U} Ul - suorytuyad ©

-qutodde dﬁv&&@.ﬂmw\oﬁo 51} UT UOREOTHOU

Mﬂ fewr Usapeld eAUPERIA JO 00T Jo1yD 9Ud SE 91BP yons U0 3910} 01Ul owod [[eus AUl (T)

'GT107C ‘suoneIN3ay (1essaI1p3d pue uonIqryolid .Goﬂqw\wohnc S1IN0D syeuIpIoqns Sit
pue 1Imod y3tH ysopeid eAUypeN °ui 1® USWIOM JO EoEmmemm [enxag pue UONEsSNISUIS
IopusD 9Ul PITED aq Aewr wﬂoﬁwﬁswvm asaul (1) - uﬁoﬁwoﬁmﬁﬁoo pue judIXd o131y 3¥0US 1

A )

AAVNINITEA
[ HALIVHO

.suonye[n39 3Uulo[10} o1 sosewt AQ3I19Y 1mo) Y3TH UL

-3q Aews 29580 94} SB “HIN0D uoﬂ_bmﬂﬂ uTUI20U0D 10 1mo) YSTH
oty ut padpol 29 Aeuw yeul syurerdurod Aue Jo ressalpal 10 pue $1.IN0D oyeurpIoqns SIt PUE 1mMoD
U3tH ysopeid BvAUPEBIN 29U} JO syouroard oYl UM UauUIOM JO JUSUWSSEBIBY enxas Jo uyonuasaid

I0] 9pOd oatsueyaiduwod e se poystqnd Suteq SIe suorpemn3ay s} M0T SyEyEHM ANV




[ smma (m)

366

Yy U9, feiw 29 31%& 2016

‘ysspeld BAUPEBA JO I0TOSIP FUTUIIOUOD 213 JO 9FpnL I2IOSIA 3unrs
o) sueaw suOnEMI3SY  jussard 93 JO JXIIUOO UL _391I3SIP 943 Jo a8pn I01IISIA, (3)

‘gysopeid BAUPEIN

JO somsnL  JOIYD  9U)  SUBSW suone[n3sy juesaid oYl JO 1X33U0D UL 3DIISNL JBYD, (p)

(0DISD) senIwmIo) sjure[dwo) [eUIiU] PUE UORBSHISUIS ISPUaD) SLINOD syeurpiogng

s11 pue 1InoD YSIH ysopeld BAUpeW 94l JO uosredirey) oyl sueow ,uosiddirey, ()

‘1rmoD yStH ysapeld BAUPEBIA JO 30nsn PO
o1 ‘1Ino)D USIH Usepeld BAUYPEBIN 93 01 UOCHE[SI Ul sueow Ajroyjny ojerzdordde (q)

. ‘G961 ‘som( B.ﬁﬁaoow SOOIAISS [MAID USSpBId
eAypey I0 303[gns SY3 U0 SI[ILI IDIAISS HNOD U3t ysepeid wmﬁ%mE oyl Aq poursacd Apesife
ST oum oﬂm&& Aure “spnur jou s90p INq spouwaid s1mod syeurpioqng sit pue HnodH
yS1H ysopeld BAUPERIN U} ur uosiad Aue Aq juouwsserey [ENX3S JO 108 \nﬂm.,o“ pa3joslgns ua9q
JABY 0] SWTE[D oym Jou 10 pakoidurs ISUISUYM ‘o8e Aue Jjo ‘orewis] Aue ‘SIINOD mﬁmﬁ%uo@ﬁw

s3I pue 1INoD YSIH yUsopeld BAUPERIA 22U} 0} UOHE[SL Ul ‘sueowl ‘ ,aeuwrom paasridse, (e)




i
St
.

367

4 (7))

wegyRy ey, feAid 29 a1del 2016

e pue YNoD USIH U3 I0f 300STf 1o1yD ol 49 pajutodde 13040 Ans189¥ V :A3€3191008 ISqUIdN (>0

o) YSIH ysapeid BAUpeEI JO somsNC JOIYD Y3 JO [0TU0D 31 19pUnt sosrwraxd a3

‘sTequIeyo s, IaAme] JO SAISTI[OUT STWIO0I-Ieq ‘sUoaluUed ‘sarrelqr

_ 10 1red 1ay30 Aue 10/pue Kresuadstp

- camestyy  ‘Sunired ‘spunoid uado ‘}o0rd QATIRIISTUNIUPY 373 gurpnour JINoD ysry ys=opeid

ﬂ vAUpPEBIN 22U} JO sostuaxd ofoym 93} SUEsl | 530UTddId HNOD yStH ysopeid eAypen, (0

| ‘OISO 93 JO ISqUIDIA B Stedul  I3qUuIdaAL, (1
‘6 uore[nday Iepun dn 19s ssprwwrod-qns Sl Sueaw 9933IWIUIOD-qNS [eUIIIUL, (u)

. ,
“yurerduoo snorasid a1y} Ul pajelouoxs

Uoaq SeBY juspuodsdy 93 2IUm 1deoxs pue Armbul ue jnommm IO UM POAJOSSI sem IopEl

o3 Iolsym JO 9AT}09dSaLIT ‘101SBI00 IST[res U0 DDISH oy} AQq PoAmedal Usdq SEY juauIsseIey

ym jsurede wosiod e s1 ,Juspuodsay [eniiqey, (3)

renxas jo jureidwio) snomaixd e WO

uag

‘4, moriern3ay Ispun pPajninsuod 2911 ILWIWOD gjure[dwo) reulaiu] pue Uuon}BsnIs
ySiy ysopeid BAUPE 943 SUBSW DDISD. 1)

IopUen SIIMOD 2ieurpioqngs sit pue 1INoD




‘STrest IS0 IO [enuell ‘OIuonodsd £q so8essow Yons Lure 10 so8essSoul [TBUI-3

‘soFessotd 1x97 ‘sofessowr U9lIHm 10 T8I0 poINoT0d ATTenxss orqelisopun 3Urpuss (a)

‘srreawr Aue Aq Tersyew 3ordxe Aenxes 10/pue fydeisourod Buniqryxa 10 Summoys (a7

‘sjrewral poInof00. A[Tenxss Sursfewr (11

‘SINOAE] [ENX3S 10 1senbal 10 pUBWIIP B ()
\ .

‘sgoueApE pUE 1081U00 reotsduyd (7

yegydy Tevd, feAiw 29 3w 2016

_: Aroureu (uoneordu £q 10 AT30911P poﬁwﬂi

motaeyaq IO $30B Woo[amUTt SULMOT[O} 93 JO 210U IO U0 Aue SopnOUl ,JUsuISSBIeY [BNX9S, (u)

‘suomemSay juesaid oy pUn
juredwio) © opeul Sey UBlIOM ﬁo@ﬂmw@ o[} woym 1SUrese uostod e sueow juapuodsay, ()
‘suoryern3ay 1ussaid 3y} £q paqurosaid sueowl _.vmnﬁowun_m: (1

‘DISD 9U3 Jo Are1a1ods IoqUISN 9U3 o9 [[BUS a8pn jotnsIg AUl %Q, pajutodde TeOWJO

368




M4 () ]

weyy e, w29 9@ 2016

¢I109JBO 3IN3jny Io juasaid 19 mege Tearyy JoIdxs I0 porduut (rx)

¢ IooIed Io Ul jusuriesi} [e1USTLOP JO T8l jo1dxe 10 parduut ()

¢ 1oared Tedsl 1oy Ul jusuriesty reguarazaid Jo astwoxd ﬁoﬂ&ﬁ 10 pordut E

‘ornjeu [Bnxos JO jonpuod [eqisa-uou IO [BqI9A ‘reotsAyd auod[eMUN 191730 Aue (x1)

“quepuodsay

oyl JO spuewop /suonenuisut 9y O3 Supjrgns JO JMS3I [erret ® I0 QATIUSOUTL

ue se “bﬁoﬂmmﬁ 10 Aprondxs Iayaym ‘S]UOUISOURADE L9318 10 gurproy S[rum Areroads

sINoAg] [BNIX3S S329S PUE JuswISSEIey [BNXas jo WLIO] Aue 01 ewom poasLISse o3

sy109ofgns pue uonytsod STy Jo 98ejUueApe soyel pcwﬁcogmom ol AgaIsys JONpuod Kue (rma)

‘syuourowt oeatrd 19U Ul QmEoE pansni33e 913 JO ‘suBsw

Lue Aq juspuodsay 943 £q uonealssqo 310} u.o ﬁobo Furpnjout Ewﬂﬁo%o\/ (t1a)

‘opISINo pue sjouroaxd s31InodD oyeurpioqng sit pue 1ImnodH Qwﬂm

ysapeld BAUPBIN Ui Ul UeTIoM Umwvﬂwww FUTMOT[0]. A UISISUO0D 10 Supireis (10




yeyey T9d, fedqiw 29 e 2016

370

. \ .
‘sjoutoald s1Ino) JreurpIoqng sil pue HNnoyH y3ig ysopeid BAUpPeEIN

31} JB JUSWISSBIEY [BNX3S 0} pa3oalqus oq [[eUS ULWIOM ON-JUIWSSBILY [ENX3S JO UORUSA3I 'E

-23pn 1OLASIJ Y3 JO [0IJUOD 3] Iopun sosturaxd a1 JO
1red 1oygo Aue Io/pue Aue It ‘Aresuadsip ‘StIoOoI-Ieq ‘sugoiued ‘sorreiqr’ Aue 1 ‘siaqure(yd sIoAmer
‘Sunsired ‘spunoid uado ‘Aue JI° 3{00[g 9ANBIISTUTIUDPY U3 SUTpNOUl SIINO02 JUIINO 10 /pue HNnodH

101L13ST(] SUTUISOUOO Y] Jo sostwaid [0y 3} Sueal sjouroaid ,s3Inc) ajeurpioqns, (0)

‘£19reS 10 uIreLy reorsAyd

10/pUE [BUOTIOWS JoY 3098 01 AJeXI[ 1US1UO0D I0 INOJ0D [BNXIS E Suraey JUsTESI} AUB(ATK) |

IO {19 IO0J JUSWIUOIIAUS
\
SI0M S[OSOY IO SAISUSJO IO JUREPTUIRUL  UE 3ureaIdo 10 MIoM ISY UM SOI9JIS1UL ()




371

4 "90mSNL JOIYD 93 £q PSIBUIWIOU 2q 03 ‘991310 )
a1y jo uosrodireyd 9l 3q [feys woym Jo uo ‘(erdns) eseysip jo aSBO 93 Ul juswdpnf o3

jo swrel Ul ‘3amod USIH 9U3 Jo (S[qe[res® 2I13Uym) 93pn[ ISULIO] SUO pue Sunats auQ (1)
:e9331wwio) 3rno) ystH oyl (e)

-Jummoroy syl spnour ‘oigeonoeid se rej se ‘[[eys
pUE oB? SISQUIS]Y / UBY3 9I0W j0U PUe G Ueyl $s97 jou Sursuduiod suonemnsal 2sa1) Jo 1038[qo
Ui mﬂa 0} SHMOQD djeUIpIOqnS IOf (DDISD) ,2eniuwo) siure[dwo) [BUISIUL PUY UOHESHISUSY

IopUSn), oY} SB UMOUY 99)]TUINOD B 9IMIGSUOD “wg‘Ebﬁ/ ur Ispio ue Aq ‘[reys e3pnpy 10MISIQ

Bt oo m_fm 29 31V 2016

ouy pue 1Moy YSTH SY} 10§ (ODISD) ,SeNIIuo) sjureldwo) [BUISIU] PUY UOHESHISUSS IopuaD,
93 SE UMOU ISPMWWOD B J1RSU0D ‘Sunrm Ul 1opio ue Aq ‘[reys somsnp jerg) syl (1) b
| HALLINIWOOS.LNIVIdINOD TYNIHLNI
ANV NOLLVSILISNAS ¥EANTD 40 NOILNLILSNOD ANV NOILLISOdNOD
II ¥4 LdVHO |

't 4 () ]




qeyey e, fArR 29 1% 2016

372

‘o3pnp 101mSIg 8yl Aq pojeurtIou

oq o1 ‘eomoeird jo sIedk Qg uelyl SS9 joU Suraey JIeq I0LISIQ JO IqUswWl IOTUSS 3UQ (tr)
‘o8pn 10LIISI 93 4 POIBUTTION 9q 03 ‘3913 Wo) 3}

jo uwosIiadireyd 9y} 29 [[BYS wWoym jO U0 ‘(exdns) BXRYSIA JO 9SBD 3] Ul juswdpnl oyl Jo SULs}
ur ‘symo) ereurpioqus 9ui jo (S[qe[rear SI19UM) 23pn[ ISULIO] U0 pue JUMIS SUQ (1)

-:33331IWUIO) }no) 3d1nsia (q)
| ..woﬂw,ﬂ_h jelssigR=lopl %.or ﬁ@wm%ou (s) wosxad .Eﬁo Auay (a)

"3911IUIWIO)) Y7 03 AIe19I09G IeqUISN w/ﬁ Se womoury [eys ‘e2msn( Jargd
o %nr pojeuIwIou oﬁ 0} wa%mm B JO UeI 93 MO[3q jou ‘A11S1393] 93 JO IIDWJo UV Ew

. 11000 YSIH 29U} Ul ‘SIEak Qg Uey3 SS9 10U 10] sonoead
remdsl Ul 91BOOADE IOTUSS UBWIOM © IO 91BO0ADE IOIUSS PIjBUIISOP UBWIOM JUQ ?E,

omsnp

JoTy) 9U1 £q pIjeurwou 3q o3 ysapeld BvAUPBIA JO S1Bd0ApE IOTUSS pareudisop 2up(m)




RN
’

[P
..
i

HeYey TogH, fedis 29 e 2016

| 4 (7))

{11 uonems3sy Ispun uonoe axe} 03 sre;f (9)
qureidwo)) remonred B ojut oImbuUl 0] 99130 -GNS [BUISIUT UB 9]NISU0d 03 STrE] (q)

‘roy /wy jsurede Jurpuad ST 30107 UI

3ureq swm oy} 10} me[ AUe Iopun sousgo ue ojul Armbur e 10 S0USJO Ue IO] PIjdIAUO0D U3a(q Sey (B)
-0DISD Y3 Jo Ioquay Aue 10 uosiadirey) a3 a1oyMm (€)

"2aMpayos
ot} wI paquosald oq Aewr se DOISH oyl Jo sdurpesocoid ayj 3UIP[OYy IOf SPUny pPaledo[re ayl. WoIf
sooueMO[R I0 S99 yons pred aq eys {)(g)y osnerd Jepun pajurodde rsquisjy opisino Y], (g)

"9917THITIO)) 9} 0} AIB}2I109S Se uonoury meys 1mMoD Jo YIaT) 24l (4)
93pnl jornysiq o) £q pajeuTiou (s) uosiad 930 AUy (Al)

-98pnp 101nsIq oU3 Aq POIBUIIOU 9q 0} | SSBID 98PN [TAID JO J[URI 93U} \,,»23

10U ‘ouIsIg RU%S@ POUISOUOD JO JUSWYSIe}So 9} U0 ‘9[qe[reae araym ‘@3pnp uewom auQ (1)
\

I




neyRY U9, feais 29 3rdfet 2016

374

‘TI0T309[9S-9.1 10 UOIBUIIOUSI 10] S[qI3I[e 99 10U [[BYS (£)y uonems3sy Iopun paAowal
ussq SBY OUm ISQUISW B pUB ‘SULS} om} Jo pourad whumxew B I0] Pajds[as/pajeurwiou SurRq

Ioquiow 913 01 3oa[gns ‘siesk oml 101 °q [[BUS 3DISDH 91 JO ISqUWOW [OBS JO WLIS SYL
-sIaquIawW 3913Tmo)) sjurejdwo) [BUISIU] PUE UWOIFBSIISUSS ISPUIN JO WIIY, 'S

‘suonem3ay] 9soyl

70 suotsiaoxd Y} YL SOUBPIOOOR Ul UOHBUTIIOU /U0NJ3]as Ysag Aq PO[[Y o] [[eYs Pajeatd 0s AOUBdeA

Sl pue ‘oq ABW 9SBO SU3 Se ‘93pn[ 10LOSIJ 9U} I0 IdTSNL IBTYD o.ﬁ JO I9pJO US1iLIM B AQ DDISDH
oyl WOJ UIMMIIIO] PIAOWAL pUBlS [[BUS 9q ABUWI 3SBD wﬂu Se ‘Ieaqusy J0 uosiadiarey)d yong

-0DISD 943 Jo

SUORoUNJ JO 9SIOISXS SU3 03 rerorpnfaid 90Wj0 Ul S0UBNURUOD ISY/STY ISpUsI 0} Se uornisod 19y /STy

pasnqe os sey ‘9q AewW 9sED 90U} s 93pnp JOLOSI(] 3Y3 I0 20msnp JoTy) 93 Jo uorurdo ayi ur (o)

10 ‘IOPUNSISY] Ponsst SISPJIo/SUORBIYROU AUE I0 SUOTR[NESY

osot Jo suorsiaoid IS0 JO UOTIULABIIUOD S}9CE IO SUSABIJUO0D 0} s3duwadlje IO soul4AeIjucd (p)




375

31?_3__2016

eyey Usd, fEAw 29

am 4 () ]

-parmbazx oq TEUS mmuonb ou Yorym 10} ‘SUIMOT[O} 3X3U m%@@ Q1 3Xeu 2}
i prey =24 reys Suns powmo(pe ue ‘Fumeoul Aue IOJ ﬁouuﬁmﬁoo jou st wmnronb o JUOA3

ot ul "DOISD ot JO SIsquustl I3 10 Uhﬁ suo 2q [reus s8uneaN e 103 wmnionb UL (S)
oum Aue je 3URSSUL E SuaAt0d Aewt DJISD 10 Joquuiatd
Aure Jo }sonbal oUW} uodrn I0 UOTouUX Tmo STy UO uosiadareyd 24l ¢ Aresso02U JI ‘IoAMOY ‘SIoqUISUI [®

01 9onj0U SARP UIASS UTNTUTUTUL U3 uosiedIreyd 2 .\mp poTred 24 ﬁdﬂw SuneaN e ‘ATTEURIO ()

-uonNosay AUl 1O gurssed 93 10 Suneaut 2} JO Surpioy 243 IO sKep J, Urgiamm DDISO

o1 Jo SIDqQUIBIN e o3 possed OS suomn[osay 244 pue 3unsswt ® Jjo seoynurir 23U} 91e[NOI
TeUs Arejsrdss IequieN °UL -pojdope pue POULIUOD ‘pPOPL00aL mn [eys s8umedtt e jo SoINUIN ()
"0DISD JO sloquUIOTL oﬁ 0} EpUS3ZE SI (FM 3uore mﬂmuo.ﬁ oy} Io

uogewInul puss ‘IOTyBQTUNUITIOO OTUOIIO[3 JO sueowl Aq 10 wﬂag Ut [eys ArelsIods IoqUIDN oﬁ\ ()
Ieok Hm.@ﬁvﬂmo e JO Hwﬁmﬁv K1ano UL 55UO

1se9] Je 19U [[BUS AOOHmUu 2973 TUIUIO)D syurerdwo) [euridl pue Goﬂwwgmﬂom Iopusn) 9UL (1) "9




ey TS, fEAw 29 a1 2016

376

01 prego1 M sdays SUMOT[O] 91 93el [[BUS DDISD UOHEIUSLI) PUB UONESHISUsS Ispush (g)

'2q Aewr 3sBO 93 SE ‘S1INn0) ajeurpiogng ‘Io 1mod
U3TH SY1 Ul JUSWISSBIBH [ENX3G JO [BSSAIPAI pue uoniuasaid pUB UONESHISUSS Ispusf 0} pIredal

UIm uoTelusa[d W S3I pUR owir} 03 own wogy K010 e Sururely Jof s[qsuodsal aq [reys 30ISDO (1)
;993310 sjureydwo) Hmnnou,nu PUE UOI}EBSIJISUIS ISPUad) 3Y3 JO suorjouny L

‘suonem3ay syl yim
30UBPICIOR UL PI[[J 2] [[BUS Poieald 0s AOUBOEA 3] PUR (oq ABW 3SBO 91 SB ‘93pn 1ou3sig 23Ul

I0 30TISNI JOTUD 9l AQ PaA0wIal 9 AewWl SUROSW SATINOSSUO0D ¢ SUIPUIIR 30U ISR V
\ :
-110day ou3 1o jureldwo) ayj JO 91BP 93 WOIJ sAep GT uey} 1s3e] jou asodind sy 10] SUnesW

' [[e0 [[eys uosIedirey) oyj pue ‘Sures 2l UOC UONOE o3e] 01 3uns’y Aousdiswy I0 AIreurpiQ
ue 1oyl [0 01 uosiadirey) oyy isenbai sAep ;2 jo pouod B URIumM [[eUs Are}aIodg-ISqUIS

S ‘ponrIqns ST 92PIUIWO)D)-qNS [ewIaiu] 2U3 Jo Hodsy B I0 paaledal st jure[dwo) e .BBQQS_,S

‘Bunieowr 913 38 Junoa pue jussaid asous Jjo Ajrrofewr ajdurs B Aq PaLLred 2q [[BYS SUONOW [[Y (9)




gy TegE, feAiE 29 3 2016

w4 () ]

“(OON) suoneziuedio U2 WIUISA0D-UON JO drey o3 ISHUS few DOISD (A1

‘sI991UM[OA ‘SUOT}BIO0SSE

-110da1 EUUE U} Ut suonemnsad
asay} Hw@ﬂs Hmmo&mﬁ oy pue ‘Aue It ‘pafT] S9SBD JO Iequinu 3} 110dey TEnUUY S3t U opnout

meys OJISD Ul -1 Aq paxmbal suonedolre Areyo3pnqg LressaosUu Uim JUOTE Teak Surmoriol

oy ut dn US¥Ed 5q 01 sdois/sIRIALOE o3 10] jurxdeniq B N0 Sunreyd pue it Kq uayeipepunt
| . ¢

sonianoe Ui Furur(ino orignd spew 29 euUsS yotum ‘5q Aewa 9sEBO 94} se ‘o8pnp 1omsid W

10 omsn JTYD AW O3 Teak Arons 1¢ IPquEedsd £q 110day TENUUV e jraqns reys ~50185 (1)

310 ‘sAerdsip ‘s918q2P ‘smoys Uy ‘g10380d

meEEuw «sdoysxIom USNOIU} ‘oq Aewr 9SEO U3 se ‘ArunuEaIod ‘S}ANOO oreurplodns

‘10 ﬁﬁoo ydig U 3O Goumwﬂﬁmﬂom 1opusd Ul 10} sourure1doid aziure3Io s DDISH ()
-gjouroald

s1Ino) oreurproqng 10 1mo) ySiyg s W JuowssereH [enxes 3o [essaIpat pue wonyuanaid

pue UOHBSHISUSS Iopued Uo %uﬂom oug Jo forgnd pnwaﬁota o1} oINSUQ [ OOHwO (1)

LQOE@#G@&O pue uonesnISUuss Iopuad

\




[ um 4 ()

ey ses, feie 29 ele 2016

378

:somIAIOR SUIMO[O] 93 9PNOUL [[BYS YoTym
Asnontpadxs uswiom poasti33e [[e o1 oﬁmqm\& UOTIBIpoW pue JUI9SUnod “qQuawodeUuBUW SISTID

aatsuodsal pue Mo.ﬂ@ ST 918Ul 1Byl aINsud [[BUS ODISD UOHEIPSN PUE uowageuey swsud (€)

‘prE JO wub_omwm reorpaw pue re8a] SUTPN[OUL S9SBD JUSWISSBIEY

[enxas o[puUey 0} WY} dmbs 0] sisojun[oA PUE SIdquUIowr Urel} pue aztue3I1o [ DDISD. (17)

, "S9INPad0Id
Due .mc.oﬂmgwwm asot; Jepun sjure[dwicd JO TBSSaIpPal [BUWLIOI” JO Mw@w o3 ur oyedronred
jou [reys g ‘DOISD Jo senumnp JuswegewBl SISLIO PUB UOHEBIPIUT SISO ° UORESHISUSS mmﬁqw.w
9} UT ISISSEB OS[e [[4 SIO9JUMIOA ‘gouepms 10 uwoneymnsuod Jo pesu ur uosred Aue IO UEUWIOM
pansr3de Aue 0} sowm [ 1B oB.mﬂm\,:m 5q [[BYS SIO9}UN[OA YOMS JO SIOVIAIIS IYJ, "SISSJUILOA
pUe SISqUIdUW S}t [Te JO (feuosiad pure TeIOjO 10q) S[reisp 310eju0d SY3 JO Lyomand pesidsepim Yl

SINSUS [[EUS PUE SISdIUN[0oA JO urea) aanejussaidal A[e1enbape ue 91BATIOE PUE ISTUS [ DDISD (a)

-somrurexdoid

9821} 1NO AIred 03 SINRLIOYINE S30IALSS .ﬂmmwﬁ pPoUISOUOD 9Y3 IO S91POq S IaAme] ‘s1ahme]




379

ey ey, fedid 29 3l 2016

[Teys yorm DOISD 2w 4q

I 4 () ]

-s1Ino) areuIploqns 10 1o YSTH 34l 1O syouroaid waﬁcw o} Ut jusWISSBIEY

[enxes Jo wLIof Aue 03 uonepl ur opewt juredwiod e Ul pquﬁwng \aqwgoﬁ\uviaogwwm

oty isurede SIsplo ssed pue ojur sxmbut 03} Tomod uAu aaey [reys OJISO Ul - £JIAT}ISUSS
ojerdwod M pue ampaooxd pPaysHqels? ST1 Uim 30UepIodde Ul I Iresp Kjeyenbape ST
trewiom passLIdde ue Jo jurerdurod A1943 1B} aInsua [Teys OISO UL _TESSaIpay Jure[duwod (+)

-Kerop InoyIL s UEPIOUT UONS JO PAYBTIRUT 24 [[eUs 31 Aq PIYRTIP:

SI091UN[OA 29U} IO/pUE SIaquIstl HOISD ‘JUSUISSEIE [BTIXOS jo sjusproul JO INO gursire SISO

ur jeys 2Insus o} ‘oq Aeur osed 2Ul 8B ‘§001AI9S AJLINDOIS SIINODH syeurplogng I0 HN0OH

sty 9ul yimm £re121098 I2qUISIN 9Ul y3noliys }0eIVOO rengol urejurew (M 31 "3ATIORJS pue

1duroxd Se [[oMm SB SATISUSS repuag uypoq ‘st 1BUl ‘yuswodeuew SISLIO JO pUE uonuaaaid

Jo wWolsAS ' YdIym £q sueow pue. shem ISP O $o0IATeS A0S (SHITOD oyeurpIoqns
I0 3meD ST oYl I 9jeUrpIo-00 M DDISD ouaumﬁﬁ 10 UONBISPISUOCD SNOIUBIXS
Kwe wrolp 93If puUe paseiqun ‘Irej ‘£rejunjoA ST JUSUISNIRS UONEIPIt pres 2y} JEU} JOSH Ajstyes
paaoxdde Amp Sureq 31 uodn AJuo S[qeadsIofus 9q pue PIjodle 29 reus

1USWISN19S PojeIpaW 913 pue ‘30ISD 2U3 JO reaoxdde JnOYIM SPNOUOD [feys UONBIpat oZ (t1)

| -s1ouroaxd s3amnod vwmﬂﬁu.ﬁoorﬁw 10/pue 1Ined Qmﬁm

51 18 1USWSSBIEY [BNXAS JO STUIPLUL 70 N0 SUISLIE SISO JO worjerpaw 2yl Ut }SISSE [ DOISD (1)




. L ‘uone3day] 3sayl W
1opun ‘osoqe (1) uomemssi-qns tod se jure[dwod B oeW AW $3S9ISIUT 197 [FIM PIUIDUOD M
Anoamp uosried ISUIC Yons I0 IRY [e39] 197 ‘uoseal. 190 Aue I0] IO Ujesp Jo ‘Ajoededur [eluswl

10 TeorsAyd 19y Jo junoooe uo jure[dwrod e SBW 0} 9[EBUN SI UBWIOM PIASLIZEE 24} 3IUM (Z)

“JIABRPIJE 21} pue SunLm Ul jure[duwod o} Fun{ewI I0] UBWIOM 31} 0] 30UB]SISSE
o[qeUOSEaI (B ISPUaI [[eys ‘aq Aewr osBO o3 Se ‘Is9umioA IO DDISD 9U3 JO ISQUIS]N SY3 ‘UOSsEal

£ue o3 onp Sunum ut jureidurod B Yons 93eW 0} S[qBUN ST UBWIOM PIASLISEE 2] 919Um JBYj PIplacid

11 Aq payrjou 0s ompaoo1d pUE ULIOY 2UF UITM SOUBPIOIIE UT ATBJSI09S.

Heggey Teras, fedia 29 e 2016

Iequaly 9Ul ySnoIyi DDISD 9y 03 ‘q Aew 9seBO 3] SE ‘sjouroard s3Imod uﬁmﬁﬂuno&dﬁm
‘10 ysopelid BAYPeRIN JO 1IN0) YSIH Y] jB JUSWSSEIBY [BNIX3S JO JIABDUJE UE Aq pojroddns unrim

ur jurefdwod e oeW ABW UBWOM PoAdIIS3E fuy (1) - juswsseiey [enxog jo jure[dwo)d °8

LNIVIdNOO OLNI AJINONI PUE HZ?J&EOO. . R

oI Y3 LAVHO




w4 () ]

Aeyey e, foAiw 29 e 2016

9911 TWIWIOD
-qng [eUIalU] JO [0IIU0D S} PUOL9Q SUOSEBII 0] anp porrad parerndns o3 uryim paja[duwod

10U ST 31 JT uonsanb Ul pa[reo aq jou [reys Armbur yons Aue jo Arpiea SU3 TBU} PopIAOIg

: \
"9913TWWO0)-qNS [BUIdIU] 23 JO UOTINITSU0D 33

j0 sKep 06 UMpM pa3oduIod pue pajonpuod 3¢ [eys jureidwo) e ojut Armbut Surpuy 1981 YL (€)

‘Armbuy oy} Jo s3urpaadoid 3131dWI0D 3y} UIIISY] 9SO[OUR PUB
110doy ® oredaxd reys .t_ Huﬁ.m,u.ﬁoﬁ pue ‘(z)e1 uonemsey jo suoismoid a1y} 03 102[gns ‘auUIUrEx? 01
ysw sonred oy ‘uosiad Ioy3io Aue pue ‘Guopuodsay 9U3 ‘UeWIOM PIAdLIZEe oY) JO SJUSUIIIEIS

9yl pIooaIl AMp pue Iesy [[eys pue Aimbur ue 10npuod [[eys 99313 TWIWI0)-qNG rewrajuy 3yl ()

© 'I9QUISW 3PISINO Ue 3uraq uosiad 2UO 1SBI[ JB pUB ‘USWOM
Suroq siequiowr Ajurofeur g ‘urjsour S UL OOHWO oy £q PojRUILIOU 0S 5q 03 se suosrad 19130
gons Io {J[asil DOISD 3Y3 JO SI3qUUISI um,hﬁ asuidwoo [Teys yorym ‘Armbur wﬂ%ﬁm 10€] B 10NpUOD
0} S_pjrIwIod-qngs feuraiuy ue uﬂﬁum_ﬂoo [reys ODISD 2y3 ‘yureidwio) 9y} JO SSaULUTNUS w,ﬁ o3

L
pre8ar i paysnes Sureq uodn pue jureidurod B 3uraredar uQ (1) -3urejdwoo ojur Axmbujy 6




( w4 (m

382

Heyey TN, e 29 31de 2016

i

uonore E.oﬁ@owﬂoo 93] pue ISHIP OS 0} SUOSBaI SiI PIOOal ‘uoszod wr juspuodsoy pue UBWIOM
vgwﬂmw,.m elop] wﬂ.ﬂwwq Ioe TeUS ODISD o3 ‘991uwo)-qng [eUIsiu] SU3 JO UOISNOuU0d /uorurdo
ol Won ISHIP OOJISD oyl JO SISqUISUI 9YYl JO  SpIy}-om} UBY} SI0W H 9913 TUIUIOD

qng reursiy] oy} Jo wodey Armbup Syl pue PIOSSI U0 [ELR}EW 33 JO UOHEBISPISUOO uodn (p)

-

1 OWSSEIRY [ENXaS I0/PUE UOHEUTITIOSIP 19puss

10y uonoe ayerrdordde axe] 01 DOISH 92Ul 0} PUSTWIWOIRL [[BYS Il ‘panoid usoq seY jUIpuUOdsY

sy jsurede uonedo[re oYl JEY] UOISTOUCD 32U} 1B S9ALLIE I9PMUMWOH-qUE [BUISIUL 94} a1aym (€)

/ .

"IDISDH 39Ul 01 A[BUrpIodde UOHBPUIWITIOI3I B 93[BW [[BUS 11 ‘poaoid usaq 10U SBY

juopuodsay] a3 1surede uone3sre Sl eyl Qoﬁﬁo o] JO ST 99130 -G [BUISIU] U} SISUM @
| | ‘sarpred PIUIIDUOD 0} PIYSIUINY

oq omH meys 1xodsI ayj jo Adoo e pue Jodidyj uons[dwod jo S1ep Ui woi sAep us} Jo woﬁum
e unpm DJISH 01 Eooog o1erdwoo im 3uore 1xodoy Anonbuy o3 jrwugqns [[eys omﬁﬂﬁaou-pﬁm
[ewrolu] 2yl ‘suonem3sy osat Iepum Armbur we jo uonordwos a3 uQ (1) - 3xodey Armbujy "01

-




383

gy ored, fAid 29 omfid 2016

w4 () ]

sjouroaxd 11no) 2yl ul (s) soerd snonordsuod Jwos je 3 SUXLIe Aq (1)

- O IUOWPE yons jo uoneorqnd m ‘uonruowpe (q)

| ‘omruowpE ()

-jUoUISSBIRY [eNxas JO WIdla 3U] 0} sonsnf 2I1noss 03 -

Iopio SUMOTO] U3 ssed 0} Iamod o3 .u\:ms meys DJISH 23 dwopm (1)6 Goﬁﬂzwmm o3 103fqng (1)

\ _ :3rodoy Armbujy uo sidpI0 ‘I1

. "[OIIUO0D S3I PUOA9q SUOSBal 03 anp pourad poyemdns ayj uryim passed jou a1

Lo ;1 worsanb UT PI[[EO 3q 10U [feys OJISD Ui JO SI9pIo 9T} 10 AIpirea 2yl 1Byl paplaoid
9o ImIwod-qns
eurojuj 9y} Jo 1roday Armbuy oy3 jo uolssTqns | Jjo sfep Funfiom G UM Euﬁwmmwmﬁ renxsas
Jo wmota 21U} 01 aofsnf 91109s 0] SE 0§ UOTIBPUSTUIO09 /suonsed3ns e oyew Keul pue memo,p, STU3
ur Aresssosu pue areudoidde oq Aeur JeUf] SI19PIO jusnbasuod w.wmnH 19]Je2IaY] PUR 931 TIuIo)-qns

eurojuy o3 jo odey Ammnbur oy Sunoafer 10 Sunydeooe 1oyie siapio ssed [reys JDISD UL (g)




e, feAie 29 a1de 2016

q

7

384

* pue ‘reaf auo jo poured wmwxew e oidn Surpusixs porrad poroads e 10j sjouroard

$1IN00) ojeurpioqng ‘1o ysspeld BAUYPERN JO HNOD YSIH 2y} 01Ul Anjus jo juswrreqsp (e)

:3UTMOTO] 913 01 ‘PSITWI J0U NG ‘SUIPNOUT 1uspuodsay] 213 jsurede sIoplo

ssed 01 ‘oq £ewI 958D 9] SE ‘98pN[ OLGSKI PAUISOU0D 913 03 10 HMOD YSIH JO 32TUsTL JOIYD U3 03
PUSWITIOdaI 01 Tamod 33 9ABY [[eys ﬂ.oQ Aewx oseO 93 Se nwgoowovﬁwﬁa 10 1Mo YISty Jo DOISHO (2)
0 ‘UemIoMm ﬁguﬂwwm.

SU} JO JUSWISSEIBRY [enxos oyl o} pus ue Sumind 10} Aressadou sdals gurpuswitrodsr/3unsassns
‘SISPIO [Te ssed ‘(z) 171 uomem3ay o1 103fqns pue ‘pourad payroads e I0f SUBIW I3YJ0 10 redisAud
‘streows oruoIyds[e ‘sofessowr ‘ssuoyd SE UONS ISUUBW AUE Ul I3 I wﬂﬂmoﬂﬂﬁaﬂhoo wIoIjy

uoniqryord ‘01 Py j0u jng ‘SUTPNOUL JOUURW AUe UL WHOlA 93 SUISSBIEY WOIJ uoniqryoxd (o)
‘aq Ae 0SBO 31} SE S1INO0D 93'UIploqng oyl 1o 1mo) Y3y ou3 jo usqam (TTh)

pue @ﬂ_%«wa

9S®BO 2U1 SE ‘SIINOD 9jeurpioqng 2y} I0 HUNoH Qmm.m a3 Jo 1ST] asned ur uoneorqnd Aq (1)

-




_.J
~
S
N
<
E

Teyy USd, fEin 29 a1¥e 2016

‘suonjoe /iuredwod awes 9y} 03 100dsa1 YImm PS[I] Us2q 9ABY ABWl

(1961 ‘10V S93EBO0ADPY 9] Iopun Surpasooid Areurdrosip & mﬂ%ﬂuﬁv Bﬁ 19130 Aue 1spun jure[durod

1010 Atre 10 jure(dwod [BUTWLID AUe ey} SUIpURISYIM]OY U0ISY3 UOLOE AUB 33E} PUE jurerdurod

e ojur oxmbur 01 UORAIPSLIN{ 9U} 9ABY [[BYS 99PUWWOD-qNS TETIOUL 94} PUe 00ISD UL (¥)
mmylroy sanred aul

o1 wﬁmw =1spl 3@8.%850,0 pue 110dsy Armbuj 9y} JO UOISSIIQNS 3U3 JO sAep 3unfiom G UTUIIM

‘oq Aew osed 2y se ‘@3pnp 301Isig SUTuIa0UO0D 9} ‘I0 HNOD y3ig jo Lomsnp jaryd 2yl ol
SUOMEPUSUILIODSI I BUW [[EYS I0 /pue 110doy Armnbuy a3 uo s1opio ssed [reys DOISD Ul (€)

71 uorem3ay o3 Hoo..ﬁﬂw UcaIa}

siopio ssed Kew ‘oq Lew 9sEO U3 Sk ‘IBPNL poﬂwwﬁ SUTUISOU0D 93 ‘10 1MoD YSIH Jo 90nusnfe

JoIYD U3} pue ‘uonoe orenrdoidde Sunye; 10j (UOTBIOOSSY ITed PUE [UNODH Iregq pouIlduod

=Yep! .wﬁ.ﬂvgoga Juspuodsay o3 Surursacd Arroyine Areur[drosIp PoULIOUO0D 93} 2I10J3q jure;durod

Kreurjdiosip e Io/pue jurerdurod reurwo e Jjo Julfy PUSTIUWIOD9I O} ‘SIsed sreurdoxdde ur (q)




386

meyey uags, fenew 29 S1de 2016

skep Ajoutu Jo polrad ® urm parereid oq [reys (1)21 uone[n3ay 1opun uonejussaidar oYL

‘I USWISSEIRY [BNXaS Jo WHOM 37 03 30nsn{ 339[dwod 21138 0} Aressaosu 2q AeW S®

SIOPIO YOons oMsSI 03 1omod 913 a4 OSTe [[BUS PUE 1Y PSWoopP SE 9pBUW UOHBPUIUWIUIOIAL ST}

10 passed SISPIO 9} AJIpOUI IO SPISE 138 O 1omod oy} aABY [TBYS oym ‘oq Aeur aseo a1} sk © a3pn[
10LOS([ SUTLISoU0D 33 ‘10 gou Y31 oyl JO 20msn B3I 2yl 03 uonelussardsal e oxew AW

1100 JOLOSI( PAWISOUO0d 10 10D UBIH 23 Jo OISO IO 1red oyl wo UONIOBUI (0)

10 UOT}OB IO SISPIO YOS wo uonejuswsidur ucu (q)

\ {(c) 11 uonemIsy Iepun

5q Afeur aseo 9y} sk ¢ 28pnp 30LOSY SUTUI20UOD 3 10 MO ySiy Jo somsnp I8ryD 3y 03 DIISD

o1 £AQ SPBW UCHEBPUSWWIODAI 10 () 1T uonen3ey Ispun DOISD Ul Aq possed r1spio o] (e)

:Aq pessti8le uosiad Auy (1) -uorjejuasaxday 'CI

‘serired oyj uo 3urpulq pue [BUY

oq [[eYs ‘eq Aew osED 29U} Se ‘98pr, 10LISIJ PIUIddU0d UL 10 OGS JAIYD 3] JO SIopio YL (c)




387

ey T99E, feAiF 29 3 2016

T 4 () ]

‘17 uomem3ay pue (S)0T uonedy
Ispun sIeplo Teuy ssed pue juspuodsay] 93 JO 90USJeP Y3 SO [[BYS IDISD o} ‘Fuspuodsay

ot £q aa0qe (1) 9snE[o Jspun ﬁuwwma I9pIO 91} JO UOHEB[OIA 10 SOUBISP ‘oouarpaqostp uodp ()

-oures ayy Aq punoq 39 [reys juspuodsay] aUl
plre uewom paAdLIsde U} ioq pue ‘tretzom paaaridde o] jo ArusIp 3y} Surpren3doyes 10 pue
Kyores reuosiad aU3 I0] parmbsr oq Aew 1BY] SI9PIO WI9IUL &oﬁw ssed Aew ‘JoaIayl pmﬂwoou
uo oym ‘oq AUl 3ISBO 3} SE ‘98pnp 10MSIg SUTUISOUO0D 3} ‘10 31AN0D YSIH Jo somsnp _LBEU
oY} 01 UOISIO9P Paudls e Ul uaxel 29 O} SSINSEBAW WLLIUT oyroads puswwiodar Aewt ‘radoid
pue 117 3 SISPISUO0d 1 JI ODISD Ul ‘crewtom passtIdde oyl Aq spewr 19fe1d usyiLIm B UO ‘Armbuf

we jo Aouopuad oy3 Jurmp pue wﬁﬂmaﬁou e jo 1dmeoaz ay3 uQO (1) -19piQ jurer}say ‘el

“HOTJEPUSUIIIOIAT IO I9PIO 9} JO UOTIEDIUNUIOD JO




(w4 ()

388

eayey erad, feAiw 29 otde 2016

‘paquosaid oq AewI Yorym ISHett 10130 Aue (o)
pUE {SIUWNO0P O uvononpold pure A19A00SIp 33 guumbai (q)

£ue Jo souEpUslle U3 SUTOIOUS pue guruowrwuns (e)
4 \

[I0] o jo 309dsal Ul 3ms © Surdr uaym 8061

‘B0 UO WIY SUTUTUIEX? PUE uostad

:A[sureu ‘soped Sutmo

‘oIpad0id [IAID JO 2POD 913 ISpun noy MAID B Ul p91S9A 918 S® siomod sures a3 9aBY

[Teys sopruwoD-qng reuraiuy sy} pue DOISD °Ui ‘Armbur ue 3upfelW JO asodmd sy 104 (€)
.mﬂoﬁwﬁﬂ&om 9S9(] JO 9jepuUBW pPUE

soA0o[qo 33 N0 ALred 01 9[qe 3¢ 03 SISPIo Lure ssed o1 zamod 9yl 2avY [Teys DDISD UL (Z)

JuolUl pue juIIds IRyl Ul suonen3ay 3ssyj Jo suorstaoxd ot} Surjuswa(duil pue

1no Surkireo jo asodind 9y} 10] pUE smpoooid s Suiqrrosaxd wﬁoﬁwowﬁog\ SIB[NOIIO 9NSST

o1 remod o1 saeY [eys DIISD Ul Ai-ovuumﬁu&oo-nﬁw [euraju] pue JDISD JO sId3mod b1

SHLLNA Pue S¥HIMOd
\

Al ¥ALdVHO




389

eyey ToreE, A 29 i 2016

£
<
2

\
Ioplo 9y} pue S)USWISSEIEY [BNX9S JO S30Uanbasuod reusd a3

a1} SB ‘SHMOD 91BUIPIO-qNg JO sjourdald pue 1moy ydiy oy} ut soerd wﬁoﬁoﬁwnou e e Kerdsip (g)

‘31ISqeM SII UO puB 9] ABUI ISED

‘oq Aew ased oY SB ‘s}ouraid 1mo) 93eurplo

-qng 10 3MoD YSTH Y} T8 JUSTUOIIAUS Jurs{Iom ofes e 9praold 0} SIINSEIW £ressooau e axe (8)

. :[[eys ‘oq Aeur 9s®D 3} SE 98pn 1oLgsI SUTISOU0D 313 10 HNOD

yStH 2yl JO 9OWJO °U3l JO 9OUEISISSE 93U pUE YL UOTIBRUIPIO0d Ul DOISD YL -s3nnd ‘ST
‘suorem3ay 213 JO suotstaoxd a3

U}1/M S0UEBPIOOOR Ul SWIT} 0} ST WOoX SoPIUIWIO)-qNG [BUIAU] 3 O} wmovooﬂﬁ ansst AewW ,ﬁ pue
SoPIUIIo)-qng [BUISIU Y} I9A0 sromod Krostaradns o>m£f sswIry e 1B [reys OJISD Ul (c)
.\Q.BUQW oUl wo. 1oNPUOD 93 Ul SBIQ Ui PIjoe |

seq ﬁ.ﬂm Kerd arey ‘eopsnl-reinyeu o sordroutid 9y3 03 Arretorpnifoxd ﬁBu.& sey] Ioquatl € Yons
et} Mmata oy Jo St It Jt ‘s0e[d .Hmn /ST Ul IoqUUaTL M3U B jurodde pue 88PTWWIO)-qNG [BUIARU] o,ﬁ IO

Joquuatu AUe oaowral Kew bﬁo.ﬁmﬁ spIp-omy Aq passed 9q 0} UOQNOS £q ODISO Ul (¥)




[ w4 (M)

390

- weyRy ed, oA 29 aifer 2016

‘jurerduroo

o3 0} predai 3umey mﬁzww.ﬂ £eur )1 se 99130 -qNS [EWIS}U] 3] J0] UOT}RULIOfUT yons ureiqo (3)
. ) 19913 TIITI0)

-qng TeUIaiU] 29Ul 210Joq SIssoum pue juspucdsaI jo wogﬁuwﬁm. oYz 3ULmoas ul 3ISISSe (J)
\ ‘Armbur we Juponpuod

pue jureldwiod 9yl Yl SUIEIp IOJ 991III0)-qNS [BUIAIU] 93U 03 SINI[IOB] AIBSS309U @@Soa (9)
‘poqrrosald aq ABWI SB IQUUBUI 3} UL 9911TWIIO) [BUISIU] 91

JO sIaquiowW 9} I0J sswrerdord UORBIUSLIO PUR suonenday] 3s9y} o3 Jo suorstaoxd syl yim ‘aq

Aeur 9s€0 91} SB ‘SLMO) 9jBUIPIO-qNS Jo s1ourssid pue 1mod YSIH oyl HIOM N0 Surdxres suostod

ou3 SulzZnIisuss I0J sTearsiur re[ndsl je sowrweidord ssousreme pue sdoyssiom ozruedio (p)

‘juswisserey [BNxss jo sjure[dwod Jo SWIOOINO0 PUE SNIB]S 93U} ‘a31Sqom §11 uo pue aq Keuwr asED

9y} SE ‘SHMO) NBUIPIO-gNG Jo sjournaxd pue 1mod ydry oyl ut aoe(d snonoidsuos e e \mmam_wﬁ (o)

‘suonenIay 1ussaid 913 I9PUN 931 THUIO0D-gNS reursiu] 2y} 3unninsuon




HegyRY I, fEAiE 29 3 2016

"4 (M) ]

\

ofoads B SunjiuIqns UewIom paasdtidde oyl uodn 3dooxs Iouueur Aue ul eipsw pue ssaxd ‘orqnd
19U} 0} UMOU3 9PEW IO P3JBOTUNIIUIOD ‘paystiqnd aq joU [[EYs pue [eRUSPUUOD 2q [eys OJISD
o1 Aq us3Ee} UONROE o} puE DDISD 93 JO suonepuswodal ‘sgurpescoid Amnbur sy3 o3 unersl
UOMBULIOIUT AUE ‘SISS3UIM PUB Juapuodsal :ﬂmao& possridde oyl Jo sossoIppe pue AJjuaprl

o171 ‘suone[ndoy 9s2U3 Iopun opewr jure[duWod 3Y) JO SJUSIU0D Y, (1) -A3rreryuspryuod ‘91
SNOANVITIOSIN

,> UALAVHO

\ ‘'suoremn3ay 3sayl Jo
uorjejuswoldull [TYSUTUBIUWL PUB JATIOSJS UEB SINSUS 0] $2INSeIW 10 /pue uotnoe 1ayjo Aue axel (f)
puUe ‘eoprmimIo)-qng rewraiu] 9yl £q syrodsi jo uolsstuqns bo&ﬂ. o1} J0ojtUou (1)

‘1orenjodiad oy 10 /pue juspuodsay] a3 jsurelde .doho,ﬁ

ur Sureq W 9U3 I0J mB[ ISYJ0 AUR IO 3pOQD [BUSd UBIPU[ 93U} IOpuUn ‘UOMOE 9)ehIur 0} Isned (1)




HeqyRy e, e 29 st 2016 [ «m 4 ()

392

_ INoY3IIM mﬂoﬂdgmwm 5$91[} IopUN JUSWSSBIBY [BNIXIS (o)

‘SUOTIEINSaY] 983U} JO Goﬂﬁﬂogwaﬂn 2ATO9Y0 U3 10} (e)

-spumny paImbaz o@go.a pUE 21800[[€ ‘S30IN0SA Hwﬁo pue

ST 2oTISTL [OTYD 9YL - SPUNJ JOo UOTIEIOIV ‘ST
_ \
"I9pUMLISY} ﬁosmwﬁ mcoﬂmomﬁoﬂ\ SIopIo/sIe[ndIo 3Yl

Uo3uUT IO JUOP ST YoTyM gurpdue o 109dsal Ul mhopﬁmﬁ st

reroueuiy Jo Kigerreae 273 0O} uow.ﬁﬁm
ﬁﬂm ‘suorie[n3ay °9s3U}

01 Juensmd Y3ire] poogd ur auop 29 01 Pap

uo 990D -qns [BuIoIul SUi pue DOISD ‘odpn
[ 1230 10 uonnossold ‘3ms ON -yyjrey poo3 ur usye} uorjoe jo uorjodjroid ‘LT

51rSI(] oY} 10 S0MSTIL JoTD 9} jsurede o1 [[eUS

sgurpasooid [e82

‘SOSSOUIIM pUEB UBWIOM passLi3ge o1} JO UOEIYNUSp!
oyl 01 pes| 03 poudisop wbmﬁﬂodhma 1ojo Aue 10 AQuopt ‘ssoIppe ‘SwWEeu 33 SuIsooSsIp
wnola Aue 01 P3Inoss moﬂmﬂﬁ =jogl

SurpreSol pojeRUIWSsSSIP 99 Kewx Qo.ﬁmﬁuobaﬁ ‘£33 pumog Sureq juspuocdsay] 2yl uodn ()
-)sonbaz pres a3 01 urpa2de DOISH o3 ﬁomﬁ pue SunLm Ul os Op 03 pmoﬂwuw

\




~
~
E
<
E

ey eTaE, faAin 29 3 2016

-gumyts 10d/000T "S¥ JO $39% pred oq 1reus ()(c)

p asnE[) Jopurt pojutodde 8@8@2 oprsINoG YL

FAAGINHN AAISLNO J0 SAONVMOTIV dO SHHL ATNAEHOS mm.E\

. -ME] I0 JUSUNOBUS IO Lue Iepun siqeysrund 30U9j0

fue Jo 90UeZIUs02 Supye) WOy 1MoD Aue Ieq jou [reys suone[nNsay 2s3Y3 Jo suotstaoid 2YlL ()
. .’edrof Ul

Sureq ouIT} 9} 10] AB[ IO Kure jo suotsiaoxd 93 JO Gomﬁwobﬁ ur jou pue 03 UonIppe Ul aq reys
suorye[n3ay] 28343} JO suorstaoxd syl (1) mel 19730 %ﬂm jo noﬂ.mwo...wv ur jou suorje[n3ay '61
| goake) mpoﬁomQSoo ‘(g 1091UM[OA ‘S39IUWILIOD-ANS

reursiu] QOISO W JO sIequIawW 33} I0] somurerdord Suiuren pue UOREIUSHLO ‘Furzraed1o 10} (9)
10 ‘suonemssy omuﬁ jo suorsoid 313 JO

onn,a o1 Jo Surpuelsispum 9y} Jo uﬂoﬁooﬂm\%m 10] pue ‘gownurerdord ssauareme jo uonezruedIo Iof

‘gTerrajewt durUTEI} PUE QoD@oESﬁEoo ‘OTIEONPD ‘UOIJEULIOIUT JUBAI[SL jo juswrdo[aAdp 10} (q)

F3Ta qeonerd, i 9 qisd qe FahIIa—2016.

W,Wwwwﬂm,wmmm'




a4 (1) ) HEAGEN TS, i 15 fawar 2017 659

HIAT-% ()
atfawm fam

fafyy i fourt s fawm
gt faAt@d 9/10 awR 2017

HL.5.4598-2017- R 8-~ (Th ) .— weayew fufae e sifufm, 1958 (i 19w 1958) H
ur 23, fafaer gfsean dfedr, 1908 (1908 &1 5) & w139 F Wy ufad R 122 AW <UE WEA Gl 1973
(1974 1 2) & U 477 TN W€D WiwA B W@ A A0 G AeAgAy, o9 gAY, T9 WEA F g4 3HIA 9,
TN, w9y e Fram, 1976 A Frafafea ok deivm @ @, stefq—
| a e
I frel W, —
1. fram 4 ¥, 30-frm (1) §, o= v 9 F WA ®, e CdE ad " wifia RRg
2. fraw 7 4,— |

(1) u-fram (2) A, wigew W, v VA R F WA W, u=x 'ue e waife fea S,
(2)  3u-tm (2) & wyEr, Feafafea 3e-fraw S s, stafq—

“(2%) I9-Fram (2) & s=ria wifta e = & sy ¥ safeaa w1 woy angas, fen =nandy
& ey w adt@ A 30 fe7 F o I e & gew ordiel WRM X WL el @b
o W, 30 AEeE fadd & fow wiwt 2Y wd WY oNydd & WAIU-UR ¥ AR &
forg e ¢ wa L '
3. Fram 9 T, oaR @en ofa '%.15.00"" & TIH W, 37 qul &fF ''%.25.00"" wfya fear s

F.N0.4598-2017-XXI-B (1).—In cxercisc of the powers conferred by Section 23 of Madhya Pradesh Civil
Courts Act, 1958 (No. 19 of 1958) Section 122 read with Section 139 of the Code of Civil Procedure, 1908 (No.
5 of 1908) and Section 477 of the Code of Criminal Procedure, 1973 (No. 2 of 1974), the High Court of Madhya
Pradesh, with the prior approval of the State Government, hcreby, makes following further amendments in the
Commissioner of Oaths Rules, 1976, namely:-—

AMENDMENTS

In the said rules,—

1. In rule 4, in sub-rule (1), for words "five years" , the words " three years" shall be substituted.

2. In rule 7,—

n in sub-rule (2), in the proviso, for the words "thirty days”, the words "sixty days"
shall be substituted.

(2) after sub-rule (2), following sub-rule shall be added, namely —

"(2a) Any Commissioner of Oaths aggrieved by the order of District Judge passed under
sub-rule (2) may prefer an appeal before the High Court within 30 days from the date of
order of District Judge. On receipt of appeal, the High Court may condone the delay and
order for renewal of certificate of Commissioner of Oaths.".

3. In rule 9, for letters and figure "Rs, 15.00". the letters and figure "Rs. 25.00", shall he
substituted,

[y & U996l & A A AT 3 I,
YD geadr,  Afafted gfaa.




AN T

660 qegyey TSI, s 15 ﬁw«—sﬂ 2017 [ 9 4 ()

No.A-2885 Jabalpur, the 6th December 2017
Annexure-A

Rules: -  The High Court of Madhya Pradesh Rules, 2008.

-~

1. In sub-rule (2) of rule 11 of Chapter XV, the following paragraph shall
be inserted between the words “Dealing Assistant” and “shall submit”,

namely:-
“after tracking the postal consignment on.official website of India Post,
Ministry of  Communications, Government of India,

(www.indiapost.gov.in) as per available status on aforesaid website”.

2. After sub-rule (2) of rule 11 of Chapter XV, sub-rule 3 shall be added as
under:-
“(3) In case after tracking the postal consignment on official website of
India Post, Ministry of Communications, Government of India,
(www.indiapost.gov.in), if status is “the service is not possible” or “it
cannot be served due to some reason” then Deputy Registrar (Judicial)

shall certify accordingly”.

3. “in Annexure (Chapter X, rule 1(9)) the words “Subject Category Code
17253” relating to “Service relating to former High Court Judge &
former Lokayukta” shall be substituted by “Subject Category Code No.

17258” which was published in Gazette Notification dated 18-09-2017”

Annexure-B
Amendments

Nomenclature: - The Gender Sensitisation and Sexual Harassment of Women at
the High Court of Madhya Pradesh and its Subordinate Courts
(Prevention, Prohibition and Redressal) Regulations, 2015.

1. The words “Approved Draft” in the beginning of the sentence “The Gender
Sensitisation and Sexual Harassment of Women at the High Court of
Madhya Pradesh and Subordinate Courts (Prevention, Prohibition and
Redressal) Regulations, 2015” shall be deleted.

2. the words “Draft 16-02-2015” and the sentence “The Gender Sensitisation
and Sexual Harassment of Women at the High Court of Madhya Pradesh and
its Subordinate Courts (Prevention, Prohibition and Redressal) Regulations,
2015” shall be deleted before para 1% starting from “whereas gender
discrimination”.




7

W4 (7) ]

HEYey IS4, feArE 15 fewrmr 2017

60l

3. The following shall be added before para 1* starting from “whereas gender
discrimination” namely:

Chapter-V

____ Contents
| SL.No. PARTICULARS Page
: o No.
1. Preamble 1-4
2. Chapter-1
Preliminary
1. Short title, Extent and Commencement. 4
2. Definitions. 4
3. Prevention of Sexual Harassment. 9
3. Chapter-II :
Composition & Constitution of GSICC, Term of Office.and their
Functions.
4. Composition & Constitution of GSICC 10
5. Term of office of Members of GSICC. 13
6. Meeting of GSICC and procedure. 14
7. Functions of the GSICC. o 15
4, Chapter-I11
Complaint & Inquiry
8.  Complaint of Sexual Harassment. 19
9.  Inquiry into Complaint. 20
| 10.  Inquiry Report. 21
11.  Orders on Inquiry Report. 22
12.  Representation. 25
13.  Restraint Order. 26
5. Chapter-IV 27
Powers & Duties
14. - Power of GSICC and Internal Sub-Committee. 27
15.  Duties. 28
6. 30

4. In clause (a) of regulation 2 of chapter-I, the following paragraph shall be
deleted after the words “precincts”, namely:-

“but does not include any female who is already governed by the Madhya
Pradesh High Court service rules on the subject or Madhya Pradesh Civil
Services (Conduct) Rules, 1965”.

5. In clause (2) of regulation 4 of chapter-II, the words “4(2) (f)” shall be
substituted by the words “4(1) (a) or (b), as the case may be,”.




; 662 ey WITE, forid 15 e 2017 [ 9 4 ()

6. And at the end of regulation under the heading of “THE SCHEDULE FEES
1 OR ALLOWANCES OF OUTSIDE MEMBER?”, the words “4(2) (f)” shall
B be substituted by the words “4(1) (a) or (b), as the case may be,”.

7. In clause (d) of regulation 15 of Chapter-IV, the word “in” shall be added
between the words “work” and “the”. The word “precincts of” shall be
added between the words “the” and “High Court”.

8. In clause (h) of regulation 15 of chapter-IV, the following sentence shall be -

inserted before the words “Cause to initiate” namely:-

“Where GSICC and Internal Sub-Committee, as the case may be, arrives at
the conclusion that the allegation against the respondent has been proved, it
shall recommend to the employer or District Judge or Registrar General, as
the case may be- (i) to take action for sexual harassment as a misconduct in
accordance with the provisions of the service rules applicable to the
respondent and/or”

Annexure-C

Amendments

e 1 R EE PR

Rules: -The High Court of Madhya Pradesh Digitization of Record Rules, 2014.

After Rule 6) of Chapter ~11I, following shall be added, namely:-

o pwmTe

“7).  Notwithstanding anything contained in these Rules, all documents, other than
those required to be preserved in perpetuity in accordance with the High Court of
Madhya Pradesh Rules, 2008, may be eliminated after being retained and secured
in electronic form and after certification as rcquired by sub-section (4) of section
65-B of the Indian Evidence Act, 1872”.

After Rule 1(d) of Chapter —IV, following shall be added, namely:

“e. Notwithstanding anything contained in these Rules, all documents, other than
those required to be preserved in perpetuity in accordance with the High Court of
Madhya Pradesh Rules, 2008, may be eliminated after being retained and secured
in electronic form and after certification as required by sub-section (4) of section
65-B of the Indian Evidence Act, 1872”.

MOHD. FAHIM ANWAR, Registrar General.

Porefeh, WD TRV AL G G, TUIRR G0 IEEE FE qEonerd, s @ i qun wehilie—2017.




	00000001
	00000002
	00000003
	00000004
	00000005
	00000006
	00000007
	00000008
	00000009
	00000010
	00000011
	00000012
	00000013
	00000014
	00000015
	00000016
	00000017
	00000018
	00000019
	00000020
	00000021
	00000022
	00000023
	00000024
	00000025
	00000026
	00000027
	00000028
	00000029
	00000030
	00000031
	00000032
	00000033
	00000034
	00000035
	00000036
	00000037
	00000038



